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Dear Colleagues, 
  
On Monday May 9, 2022, at the Special Meeting of the Bloomington Faculty, 
two resolutions received the majority of votes. As per the Constitution of the 
Bloomington Faculty (Article IV section 4.4) we must now forward those action 
items to the full voting eligible faculty because 800 members were not in 
attendance.   
 
You will receive an electronic ballot on Monday May 16, 2022. Please do not 
ignore it. This is an opportunity to join in shared governance and positively 
exercise your authority as a faculty member of the Indiana University 
Bloomington campus. Before you vote if you haven’t had the opportunity to 
read the resolutions, I will include the text below. Click here and here for 
information sheets from the creators of the resolutions that offer their 
perspectives on the facts. Click here for an information sheet from the 
Provost’s office that provides information regarding issues of Student 
Academic Appointees (SAA). 

https://click.e.iu.edu/?qs=9a1a66b6f5e1011a5df650e1ace5951173b19e6c25df38a6e8c5ba970a958bfd71d23677cd05758facac0ae4931215a3c868acc415606ce2
https://click.e.iu.edu/?qs=9a1a66b6f5e1011a0f681f77970131a09451225114bb42ab9ad0712c9df4acd5588d0dda6aeac6a863a82d277c4ac0b42ea479eb41ec18cd
https://click.e.iu.edu/?qs=9a1a66b6f5e1011a4fa5133135a18249bf6617445c8c235959f943fd0d91a8e24e73d7afc6a8121510fdea371c2fdf44817f32a7d622b4e9
https://click.e.iu.edu/?qs=9a1a66b6f5e1011a1b8a6f129faf01667204abe3a5317bb2007b48c1ef687e0f740bb05dfe7fdee21a6f99da30189694aa9ec8d566b30187


  
We as faculty members have many things competing for our attention and 
time. The effort you make to familiarize yourself with the information available 
will yield a result that reflects the collective will of the fully informed faculty of 
this campus.    
 
Successful shared governance depends upon each of us doing our part. Now is 
the time. I hope you will read the resolutions, read the information sheets, have 
conversations, and ask the questions you need to ask before casting your vote 
next week. Shared governance is important, your voice makes a difference and 
your vote counts! 
  
All best wishes,                      
  
Marietta Simpson 
Bloomington Faculty President 
   
RESOLUTION #1 A RESOLUTION OF THE BLOOMINGTON FACULTY 
CONCERNING SHARED GOVERNANCE AND GRADUATE STUDENT 
SUPERVISION 
 
Whereas, IUB policy and AAUP standards both guarantee that SAAs may not be 
sanctioned without due process, 
 
Whereas, supervisory authority over SAAs rests with the faculty within the units 
or Schools and departments, Whereas, the Graduate Academic Appointees 
Guide states that reappointment of SAAs is determined by “the specific 
appointment policies of the Department or School”, 
 
Whereas, supervisory units (e.g., Departments and Schools) are the appropriate 
offices for assessing the criteria for reappointment listed in the Graduate 
Academic Appointees Guide,  
 



Whereas, the principles of shared governance call upon the faculty to review 
the performance of campus academic officers and administration on an 
ongoing basis, as specified in Article II, Section 2.1.A.1.g of the Constitution of 
the Bloomington Faculty, 
 
Whereas, the legislative authority of the campus regarding the academic 
mission, as well as student conduct and discipline, resides with the faculty, as 
specified in Article II of the Constitution of the Bloomington Faculty,  
 
Whereas, the IU Bloomington faculty observes that any sanction or non-
reappointment of SAAs must follow normal appointment and/or disciplinary 
procedures as determined by the supervisory units, 
 
Resolved, the IU Bloomington faculty asserts (1) as per the Graduate Academic 
Appointees Guide, reappointments of SAAs are determined by departmental 
and school policies; (2) no SAA will fail to be re-appointed in Fall 2022 due to 
participation in the Spring 2022 SAA strike, including failure to turn in Spring 
2022 grades in a timely manner; (3) the VPFAA will immediately release the 
SAA appointments for Summer 2022; (4) as per the Constitution of the 
Bloomington Faculty, the faculty will review the performance of the 
administration with respect to future labor disputes; (5) the BFC will ensure that 
all disciplined students receive due process for grievances via the SAA 
mediation and review structures of the BFC; (6) the BFC will re-constitute and 
empower the new SAA Affairs Committee to strengthen and clarify IUB policy 
for SAAs, particularly emphasizing the central role of the department, program, 
or other supervising unit concerning SAA reappointment.   
 
RESOLUTION #3B – A RESOLUTION OF THE BLOOMINGTON FACULTY 
CONCERNING STUDENT ACADEMIC APPOINTEES AND ADMINISTRATION 
 
Whereas, Student Academic Appointees (SAAs) play an essential role in the 
educational and research mission of IUB; 
Whereas, SAAs are both students and IU employees; 



 
Whereas, as employees, SAAs have the right to organize, associate collectively, 
and, when necessary, to strike; 
 
Whereas, as students, SAAs have rights of academic freedom and shared 
governance that are best protected when they are organized and well-
represented; 
 
Whereas, campus administration has ignored resolutions from the Indiana 
University Student Government, the Graduate and Professional Student 
Government, and the Bloomington Faculty Council urging sustained and 
meaningful dialogue with the IGWC-UE; 
 
Whereas, the Indiana Graduate Workers Coalition (IGWC-UE) has been 
organizing and campaigning on behalf of SAAs and has gained significant 
support as shown by a supermajority of SAAs (at least 1,700) who have signed 
union cards; 
 
Whereas, graduate employee unions are recognized at six of fourteen Big Ten 
institutions, including four in “Right to Work” states, and at Ivy League 
Universities such as Harvard, Yale, Columbia, and Brown; 
 
Whereas, the three most highly rated public R1 institutions in the Carnegie 
metrics, University of Wisconsin Madison, University of Michigan, and 
University of California Berkeley, have graduate unions; 
 
Whereas, the Bloomington faculty acknowledges the fact that the IGWC-UE is 
on the path to be chartered this summer as an official United Electrical Workers 
union local; 
 
Whereas, the Bloomington faculty acknowledges that the Board of Trustees 
has the authority to ratify contracts negotiated by campus administration; 
 



 

Whereas, the Bloomington faculty acknowledges that the Provost and campus 
administration have the authority to negotiate with a recognized bargaining 
agent; 
 
Whereas, the Provost is not legally constrained in which campus groups he can 
meet and dialogue with, 
  
Resolved, the Bloomington faculty calls upon 1) the Board of Trustees to work 
toward a permanent resolution to the labor dispute on campus, including the 
arrangement of free and fair elections on union representation for eligible 
graduate SAAs similar to the process described in HR-12-20(“Conditions for 
Cooperation Between Employee Organizations and the Administration of IU”); 
2) the senior campus administration to immediately engage in sustained and 
meaningful dialogue with the IGWC-UE to facilitate the normal operation of the 
missions of the campus in the short term. 
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